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Phi metallic mineral production up
copper prices dipped by 14.84percent metallicmines in a regio the GBdata
and 0.64percent, respectively. showed Caraga remain d as rie coun-

Thevalue 0 the country'smetallicout- MGBdata showednickelore,together try's mi ing hub, wit 1. two gc d mines,
put expanded I y nearly 30percent in the with itsnickelby-products- mixednickel- one chromitemine, 18n' el es, one
three quarters ending September,owing cobaltsulfide(MNCS)and scandiumoxa- . hydrornetallurgicalpr c in lant arid
to higher outp t and prices ofnickeland late - continued to have the largest share a gold processingplart.
gold, the Min s and GeosciencesBureau at49.4percent,contributingP86.94billion. For the period, BSP io1d urchases
(MGB)said. Gold came in second, cornering38.32 amounted to about P16 ~6bil.ion, with
Metallicmi eral production remained percent and raking in P67.45billion. five go ld buying

upbeat as its value rose by 29.21percent Copper tookthe third spot,accounting stations strategi-
to P175.61billion. for 10.79percent with a value of P18.99 callylocatedacross
"The important factors for this devel- billion. the country.

opment were the bullish metal prices The collectivevalue of silver,chromite Mea n w h i l e ,
of nickel ore and gold, paired with the and ironorecontributedaboutl.49percent nickel direct ship-
increased mi e output of gold, silver, of the total at P2.63billion- the first time ping ore declined
chromiteand i onoreduringtheperiod," that the joint values of these three com- by 17 percent in
the MGBsaid. moditiesexceededthe PI-billionmark. vol u m e fro m
Prices of nickel ore went up by 47.2 MGB said a big factor was the m- 27,238 J H:7 4 dry

percent to $11£7per pound. creased output of TV!ResourceDevel- metric tons to
MGB said he nine-month price of opment (Phils)Inc.'sBalabaggold-silver 22,525,878 DMT.

nickelwas still bovethe2018-2021levels, project from 1,170kilogramswith an es- However,it record-
withpricespe . g inMarchat $17.14per timated value ofP41.26million to 19,088 ed a two-percent
pound while the third quarter average kilograms with an estimated value of increaseill termsof
settled at $10.02per pound. P736.76million. value from P45.97
China is the Philippines'major trading "Overall, there was a remarkable in- billion -:0 P46.82

partner for nickel ore. creasein the value ofmineral commodi- billion.
Gold also sfiw a 1.36 percent price ties year-on-year," the agency said. Thego remment

increase from $1,801.97per troy ounce In terms of regional contribution, the plans to tap the
to $1,826.47year-on-year, based on the MGB data showed the Caraga region potentia _of the
Bangko Sentral Ng Pilipinas (BSP)price cornered 37.26percent of the total pro- mining sector
bulletin. Itsnine-month averagewent up duction valued at P65.57billion. to push for the
from$1,801.97per troyounceto$1,826.47, It was followed by Mimaropa with country'seconomic
evenas its third uarter averagepricewas 11.19percentatP19.69billionandCagayan growththrough the
lower year-on- ear. Valleywith 10.58percentat P18.62billion. declarationofmore
On the other hand, both silver and In terms of the number of operating MinahangBayan.----------~----------~~-~-
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Higher prices push mineral prod'n val
nJED MACAPa\QAL

METALLIC mineral produc-
tion value jumped 29.21 percent
in the first nine months of 2022
to P175.61 billion from P136.21
billion in the same period in 2021,
according to the Mines and Geo-
sciences Bureau (MGB).

MGB attributed this to higher
metal prices of nickel ore and
gold paired with increased mine
output of gold, silver, chromite
and iron ore.

In a report, MGB said nickel ore
and its nickel by-products, mixed
nickel-cobalt sulfide and scandium

oxalate continued to have the larg-
est share with P86.94 billion or
49.40 percent.

This was followed by gold with
P67.45 billion or 38.32 percent and
copper, P18.99 billion or 10.79
percent.

The combined mine value of
silver, chromite and iron ore ac-
counted for P2.63 billion or 1.49
percent.

In terms of production, gold
improved by 16.7percent to 21,836
kilograms (kg) from 18,715 kg; sil-
versurged by 131percentto 41,710
kg from 18,045 kg; copper went up
by 22 percent to 190,767 dry met-

ounce from $1,801.97 per troy
ounce.

Copper prices dipped by 0.64
percent to $4.12 per lb from $4.15
per lb while silverprices went down
by 14.84 percent to $21.94 per troy

HIGHER
ounce from $25.77 per troy ounce.

The MGB said metal prices
could have dropped in the fourth
quarter and will likelygo down up
to 2023 due to weakerglobalgrowth
and concerns over a slowdown

dmt;
nt to

100,447 dmt from '[0,816 t; and
iron ore increased by 51 perc nt to
57,040 dmt from 37,785

Direct shipping ore nick I was
the only component that e peri-
enced a decrease ill produ tion,
by 17 percent to 27.24 millio dmt
from 22.53 million dmt.

The average price of nick lore
for the period surged by 7.21
percent to $11.97 ~ lb from 8.13
per lb while gold in creased b 1.36
percent to 1,82647 per troy

SeeHlGHER>

in China's demand d ie to its ero
COVill policy

The agency said t p':ices are till
expected to remain higher than eir
average ver the past Iiveyears.- ed
Macapagal
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Trapped K inga
miner meets tragic end
BY A.I.JM7IN QUITASOL

BAGUIOCITY- Authoritiesfrom the PasilMunicipal
PoliceStation reported that a miner who was trapped in
a rubble inside the "mlnahang bayan" ofSitioMa~dgad,
Barangay Galdang, Pasil in Kalinga.

The miner was identified as Milnar Wa-ilBag-ayan,
a resident of Barangay Galdang. His remains were
recovered at 6 a.m. of 4 December.

Reports from the Pasil Municipal Police Station
disclosed that it has responded to a call from the
barangay local government unit of Galdang informing
them of a trapped miner due to eroded boulders in a
mine site at the Minahan ng Bayan at Sitio. agadgad.

Search and Rescue team from the Pasil Municipal
Disaster RiskReduction Council proceetled to the area
but was met by civilian rescue volunteers who were
able to recover the victim's body.

PAGE
--~~--==~------
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Minero na-trap sa gumuhong tunnel, tepok
BAGUIO CITY - Patay

na nang maiahon ang
isang minero matapos rna-
trap at matabunan ng ma-
lalaking bato nang gumuho
ang tunnel ng Minahang
Bayan sa Sitio Magad-
gad, Brgy. Gaidang, Pasil,
Kalinga noong Unggo ng
umaga.

Kinilala ang nasawing
biktima na si -Milnar Wa-il
Bag-ayan, 35, residente rin
ng naturang lugar.

Ayon sa Pasil Police,
agad silang rumesponde
sa naturang lugar matapos
makatanggap ng tawag

mula sa barangay hinggil
sa ulat na may natabunang
minero sa Ioob ng tunnel na
gumuho.

Habang papunta sa
nasabing lugar, nasalu-
bong na nila ang mga
civilian rescue volunteers
at karga ang katawan ng
biktima.

Sinubukan ng medical
professional ng pulisya
na i-revive ang biktima
subalit namatay ito dakong
ala-1:40 ng hapon noong
Disyembre 4, 2022.

Sa imbestigasyon, pu-
masok sa mine site ang

biktima bandarq alas-~II,g
hapon noong Sabado.

Nabatid na dako Ig
alas-6 ng umaqa, nap an-
sin ng kapwa minero na
hindi na nakabcJik pa £lug
biktima sa kanilang bar-
racks kava agad nilMg
ipinaalarn ita sa iba pa 9
kasamahan na gumalu£ad
sa tunnel at nataqpua Elng
katawan nito na ,akaliblng
sa maIaIaking tipak ng bato.

Ang bangkay ng I~:-
tima ay dinala na sa ~f -
yang tahanan sa Bara -
gay Galdang. (Artemia .
Dumlao)
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Minero. todas
sa gumuhong kuweba

TODAS ang isang minero matapos itong makulong
at matabunan ng gumuhong kuweba sa bayan ng
Pasil, Kalinga noong Linggo ng umaga.

Kinilala ni Pasil Police Station (PPS) chief-of-
police P/Maj. Garry Gayamos ang biktima na si
Milnar Bag-ayan, ng nasabing bayan.

Sa inisyal na report, ang biktima ay nasa loob
ng kuweba na matatagpuan sa Barangay Galdang
nang bigla itong gumuho bandang alas-6:01 ng
umaga_ -

Agad na humingi ng tulong ang mga kasamahan
nito at ilang oras ay narekober ang bangkay ng bik-
tima ng emergency response team ng Pasil.

Samantala, dinala na ang katawan ng biktima
sa kanilang bahay sa Barangay Galdang ayon na rin
sa kahilingan ng pamilya nito. (Allan Bergonia)
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Change climate!

Climate change, climate
change. The bad news is
there's nothing we can
do to stop it or reverse

its irreversible course.
Howmany centuries to cre-

ate another glacier to replace
one that's melting away? How
many magicians to build a
mountain and cover it with
trees, populate it with flora and
fauna? How much H20 to pro-
duce from rainfall to construct
a dam that will serve millions
every second of every day?

Change climate is an easier
option, Change your wardrobe,
for a start, beginning with
government officials who are
so lucky to spend eight hours
in an airconditioned office. By
the way, are they sticking to the
policy to keep the temperature
within a certain range, like 23-
25Cat low cool, unlike the rest
of us sweating and sweltering in
our thinnest cotton garments in
36Cheat in the jeepney, bus, or
while waiting for a ride?
, As far as Lean observe, Sen.
Francis Tolentino appears to be
the only newsmaker who knows
how to keep cool. While others
are stylishly official in their
long-sleeved shirts and jackets,
dark pants, and silk neckties,
the senator looks comfort-
able and fashionable in casual,
short-sleeved shirts in light
colors. Fashion demands that

MEDIUM RARE'
JULLIE Y. DAlA
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Cli ATE CHANGE SUPERCHARGES THREAT FROM FORE,;T-EATIN BUG
HELSINKI-De p in the Finnish
woods, the mo s and blueberry
shrubs hide a eadly threat to
the boreal for sts that are as
important to t e planet as the
Amazon rain fo est.

With chun s of their bark'
peeling off an needles falling
from dying bra ches, more and
more trees are being killed by
the spruce bark beetle; which is
venturing furt er and further
north with clim te change.

The tiny brown insects at-
tack the Piceal abies, one of
Finland's most common tree
species, and can cause massive
damage to forests.

Burrowing through the
bark to lay their eggs, the bee-
.tles eat their way around the
spruce and kill it by stopping
water and nut ients reaching
the higher bran hes.

"The speci has caused

huge damage across Central
and Eastern Europe, especial-
ly since 2018," Markus Melin,
a scientist at the Natural Re-
sources Institute Finland, told
Agence France- Presse (AFP).

With climate change, the
risk of the beetle spreading is a
"lot higher now,"Melin added.

"We have to accept it and
adapt to it. Things are changing
fast up here."

While the threat is greatest
in southern Finland, the swel-
tering summer of 2021 saw bark
beetle damage "unusually high
up north" in the Kainuu region
of northern Finland.

"It is well known that the
spruce bark beetle is one of the
species that benefit most from
global warming," Melin said.

The beetles thrive on weak-
ened trees. Hot summers mean
there are more water-starved

spruce, while warm winters
mean there is no frozen ground
to brace the trees against storms.

Warm weather also speeds
up the life cycle of the beetles,
meaning they can reproduce
faster.

"Extreme warm summers
benefit the bark beetle directly.
They have less mortality, repro-
duction is faster," Melin said.

While the beetles nor-
mally go for weak trees, once
their numbers reach a tipping
point they can start attacking
healthy ones.

"It becomes a nasty loop,"
Melin said.

If foresters do not react in
time by removing weakened
spruce, "suddenly there are
,so many beetles that they can
attack healthy trees" further
speeding the "cycle of destruc-
tion," Melin said. -AFP

CAUGHT IN ASTY LOOP
Mature spruce trees are dying
in the Finnish Lapland due to
wood bugs whose numbers
are growing because of longer
summers. -AFP
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Nl.illgpUputokang butse
ni Cynthia Villar (2)

WALANG positibong reaksyon sa publiko kapag binabanggit
ang pangalan ni Cynthia Villar. Kapag nabanggit, santambak na
neg~.ti,bong reaksyon ang maririnig upang uriin ang kanyang
pagl(~tao: matapobre; mapanlait; mayaman na abusada pero wa-
lang a lam; mababaw. May mga personal na akusasyon pa. Hindi
siya kagiliw-giliw sa mata ng publiko publiko kahit nanguna siya
umarlo noong 2019 sa halalan sa Senado.

Hindi maintindihan kung bakit hindi siya nakuha ng Writ of
Kali\f,!~an na kanyang isinampa na petisyon sa Korte Suprema
kontra ~)E'NR, PRA, E\1B, Alltech Contractor at iba pa kaugnay
ng sakdal upang itigil ang 634-ektarya na reclamation project sa
baybdy dagat ng Las Pinas City at Parafiaque City. Ibinasura ng
KO~I!~llprema noong 2021 ang petisyon ni Cynthia na humihingi
~g N~of Kalikasan, Hindi natigil ang proyekto kahit ano ang
inga ,It tara)' mya.

Unang iniatas ng Korte Suprema sa Courts of Appeals (CA) ang
petisycn ni Cynthia. Ibinasura ito ng CA noong ika-26 ng Abril
2013. Isinampa ang sakdal sa Korte Suprema at pagkalipas ng
walong taon, kinatigan ng Korte Suprema ang desisyon ng CA.
Hindi nagbago ng katwiran ang kataas-taasang hukuman. Nabigong
patunajaa ni Cynthia na may malaking panganib ang proyekto sa
kaligiran ang proyekto.

Hindi napatunayan ni Cynthia na magbubunga ng matinding
baha ang proyekto sa siyudad ng Las Pinas at Paranaque, Hindi
kinatigan ng Korte Suprema ang mga argumento ng kanyang karn-
po. Wilbng matwid para maglabas ng Writ of Kalikasan ang husga-
do at 1!tiluyang pigilan ang reclamation project. Matinding sampal
ito sa mukha ni Cynthia.

Kinat igan ng Korte Suprema ang sinabi ng CA na hindi napa-
tunayam ug mga isinumiteng katibayan ni Cynthia na totoong
malulubog sa baha ang dalawang siyudad. Pangunahin ang mga ebiden-
siya a~lg pag-aaral ng Tricore Solutions, Inc. (Tricore), isang re-
search firm, at Center for Environmental Concerns-Philippines
(CEC-P), isang civil society organization. Kinwnisyon ni Cynthia
ang dallawang organisasyon, ayon sa CA, ngunit hindi umano sila
gumawa ng mga mahahalagang pag-aaral sa larangan ng hydrology
at hy~aulics upang patunayan na magbabaha dalawang siyudad,

Ayon sa Korte Suprema: "The CA did not give credence to
Tricore's report wherein it was concluded that the proposed project
would cs.use an increase in flood depth and inundate two-thirds of
Las Pifias, Parailaque, and Bacoor for lack of sufficient basis. For
the CA'! tt.e findings in Tricore's report were refuted by Alltech
who walll able to establish that measures were designed to mitigate
the dreaded negative impacts of the proposed project.

"The CA also did not give credence to CEC-P's study. The CA
noted that SEC·P already had a conclusion in mind when it con-
ducted its study at Villar's behest as it deliberately ignored the ECC
and the studies conducted by DCCD Engineering Corp. (DCCD),
Surbana ,[nternational Consultants PTE Ltd. (Surbana), and DHI
Water & Environment (S) Pte. Ltd. (DHI). The CA also noted
that CEi~.F' relied on the EPRMP submitted in August 2010 and
not the final EPRMP Alltech submitted in December 2010, mak-
ing its f;i~dings inaccurate and unreliable.31

"The CA also held that the precautionary principle, which shifts
the burden of proof to the project proponent to prove that the
threat to the environment does not exist, cannot be favorably
applied to Villar's cause. The CA explained that the threat was not
establishe~ and that the volumes of data generated-by objective
and expl!llt analyses ruled out the scientific uncertainty of the
nature alid· scope of the anticipated threat. Thus, the CA was not
convinced that sufficient ground exists to grant the privilege of

- i -

the writ of kalikasan."
Matindi ang implikasyon ng desisyon ng Korte Suprema na tu-

luyang nagbabasura sa petisyon ni Cynthia Villar at kumatig sa
naunang desisyon ng CA na hindi bigyan ng Writ of Kalikasan
upang itigil ang reclamation project. -Isa ang CEC-P sa mga civil
society organization na main gay at walang tigil sa batikos sa rnga
reclamation project sa Manila Bay. Isa ito na nagtataguyod ng
programang "reclamation-free Manila Bay."

Ipinakita ng desisyon ng Korte Suprema noong 2021 na hindi
lubos na naniniwala ang husgado sa ipinaglalaban ng CEC-P. Ku-
lang sa agham, ayon sa Korte Suprema. Kulang sa mga batayang
siyentipiko upang kumbinsihin ang hukuman na may matuwid ang
kanilang panawagan na itigil ang mga reclamation project sa Ma-
nila.Mukhang hanggang ingay sila at wala talagang mailabas na
totoong patunay na may problema sa mga reclamation project.

Batay sa desisyon ng Korte Suprema, hindi kami sigurado kung
tuluyang makukumbinsing CEC-P at ng civil society na may batayan
ang kanilang pagtutol sa mga reclamation project sa Manila Bay.
Mukhang isa itong dahilan kung bakit hindi sila naghaharap ng
anumang sakdal sa hukuman upang itigil ang mga reclamation
project. Walang bilib ang husgado sa civil society sa kanilang mga
batikos.

Minsan sinabi ni DENR Secretary Antonia Yulo-Loyzaga sa kan-
yang pagharap karnakailan sa budget hearing ng Senado na iba-
batay sa agham ang anuman desisyon n~ gagawin ng kanyang opi-
sina. Sapagkat kulang sa agharn ang batikos ng civil society sa mga
reclamation project sa Manila Bay, hindi kaya ito na ang sagot ni
Toni Loyzaga sa ingay ng civil society?

Maingay sa mass media ang mga civil society organization bag-
aman walang silang inilalabas na tuwirang sagot na batay sa agham
sa mga reclamation project. Marapat na mag-usap-usap ang iba't
ibant samahan at organisasyon na nanawagan ng reclamation-free
Manila Bay. lIabas ang mga pag-aaral at datos kung mayroon tala-
gang ilalabas, (Tatapusin)

***
SA DAMI at uri ng batikos laban sa panukalang Maharlika Wealth

Fund, hindi kami magtaka kung iurong ni Ispiker Martin Romual-
dez ang panukalang batas na nagtatakda ng panibagong pondo para
sa gobyerno. Tanging si Joey Salceda at Migz Subiri ang nanindigan
at matiyaga na ipaglaban ang panukala. Bantulot ang maraming
mambabatas na tumayo sa usapin, Naunahan ng pangarnba at takot
sa delubyo ng mga kumokontra sa panukala.

Sarnut-saring kuro-kuro ang inabot kontra Maharlika Fund. Ani
Raissa Robles, mamamahayag: "The unpaid Marcos estate tax is at
least P203 billion, while the Maharlika Wealth Fund seed money
needed is P275 billion. So the unpaid Marcos estate tax could
actually COVER most of that needed seed money. Problem solved!"
Sa maikli, pagbayarin ang mga Marcos sa kanilang utang sa buwis at
hindi na kailangan ang Maharlika Fund.

Pinagtatawanan si Salceda sa kanyang pahayag na "risk-free"
ang Maharlika Fund. Malinaw na kagaguhan ang kanyang sinasabi.
Walang reputasyon ang panukala dahil isinulong ito ng mga Mar-
cos at Romualdez na tinitingala dahil sa pandarambong nila sa
kaban ng bayan. Hindi sineseryoso si Salceda, Hindi siya dinidibdib.

May sinabi rin na mahalaga si Neri Colmenares, dating kongre-
sista: "Ang kailangan natin dagdag na SSS pension, hindi dagdag na
pagkakataon sa corruption. I say no to the Maharlika Wealth
Fund." Sa totoo, puro pakabig lang ang gobyerno. Hindi nagtutulak
or nagbibigay sa mga mahihirap. Sobrang pahirap ang gobyemo sa
sambayanan.

"It is worrisome and suspicious that the pompany created by the
proponents would invest money which isn't theirs. Apart from
conflict of interest, this could become a 1est of corruption," ani
House Deputy Minority Leader France Castro

***
MGA PILING SALITA: "The Duterte administration probably

thought that a nondisclosure agreement woul~ shield them from audit.
The WB and ADB don't work that way. All fundings are subject to
audit. Professional ang mga yan~ hindi t,ulad n~ ka-d~Inilang Chinese
na puro hao siao." - Joel COChiCO,netizen, SOCIalentre

"Ito ang sabi ni Kris Aquino: Sabihin naang nais ninyo kontra sa
aking ama. Pero isa siyang bayani sa sambayanang Filipino. Tama!"
- PL, netizen
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INVITATION TO BID
The National Mapping And Resource Information Authority,. Bids and Awards
Committee (NAMRlA BAC) invites interested bidders for the following project:

1. SUPPLY A1'fD DELIVERY OF DIGITAL TOPOGRAPHIC LfII'E MAPS WITH
ORTHODIAGES AT 1:50,000 SCALE ccverfng duster of provinces listed, as
follows: .

1. CLUSTER 1
OrientaJ Mindoro. Occidental Mindoro and Northeastern Portions of Mindanao
Approved Budget for the Contract - PhP 20,098,000.00

2. CLUSTER 2
Negros Orient:al and Negros Occidental
Approved Budget fo,.. the Contract - PhP 20,286,000.00

The bidding echeetuje is aN Co]l(Y'W'$::
1. Issuance of Bidding Documents:
2. Pre-Bid Conference;

Starting December- 1. 2022

10:30AM December- 7,2022
NAMRIA Bcardroornykecture Hall
Fort A. B<>ni!acio,Taguig City

lO:30AM. December- 22, 2022
NAMRrA Boardroom/Lecture Hall
Fort A. Bonifacio, Taguig City

The NAMRIA RAC reserves the rfght to cancel the bidding proceas, to re-Ject any
or all bids, to waive any infonnality in the bids r-eceived and to accept such bid most
advantegeoua to the goverrunent.

3. Deadline of Su.bmission and
OpenID$ of Bids:

:DIt.~ BELENv=
~A~ •
.ml.MlAltA-''''~ l~l""C".J'HQfP1).l.....a1""l
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.
I . Republic of the Philippines

•• Depa-trnent of Environment and Natural Resources
.~ NATIONAL CAPITAL REGION
National Ecology Center East Avenue, Ditirnan, Quezon City

SALE OF PUBLIC LANDS

Notice is hereby given that :he Department of Environment and Natural
Resources, National Capita( Region, Patents and Deeds Section, LPDD, in
pursuance to Administrative Order No. 38 dated 19 April 1990, will sell at
.IJftJ.E ·NCR Licenses Patents and Deeds DiVision National Ecology Center
~lyenue Dilimaa Quezon City, through sealed bidding to the highest
bldde' at 10:00 A M. on MARCH 28, 2023, the tract ofland situated in llJ:gy.
~~rn Bicuta" ,pinagsama) Taguig City which are specifically described
below to wit:

LOT NO/
8UL •• -/
••.•• 00.

•••• ,. I -I TOTAl. I TOTAl.
SQ.M. VAWmP£R VALUEOF YAl.UI!OF

SQ.M. LAIC)

60.30 lQ.m., ,PhP140.00 IPhPS.442.001 PtP45O,(O)..OO

AI' t -ids must be sealed and submitted to the above-mentioned Division.
on or bstorethe r our and date stated above and plainly marked • Bid for land
Descrioed in MSA / SA / IGPSA No. 007607-2195 • Bids must be
accompanied wi::h cash, money, order, treasury warrant, certified check,
cashier's check or manager's check for a sum equivalent to 10% ofthe bid.
Then a bid is wi:hdrawn after the highest bidder is determined, the
corresponding deposit therefore shall be forfeited to the government. No bid
shatl be less tha1 the appraised value of the .and. The right is reserved to
reject any or all bids.

Que!onCity,P.'liliopines ~.

(Sgd.)
ATTY_ ALVIN JOSEPH G. CONSTANTINO

Ctuef.Licenses, Patents and Deeds Division

Department of Environment and Natural Resources
NATIONAl.CAPITALREGION

SALE OF PUBLIC LANDS

Notice Is hereby g.ven that the Department of Environment and Natural
esouroes, Nati01al Capital Region, Patents and Deeds Section, lPPD, in

oursuerce to Administrative Order No. 38 dated 19 April 1990, will sell at
/!H:J.CR Uceoses PatentsandDeecisDivisjon NatjooalEcologyCeoter.
L~.t{·nue mUman QUezon City, through sealed bidding to the highest

bidder it 10:00 A.M. on MARCH 28,2023, the tract of land situated in
~:lQYAI Fort 30nlfacio Tagujg Cjtvwhich are specifically described
below tc Wit:r- _ ..

LOT NOI 'II! ....,. - TOTAl..- .....,..., 8lX. frIO./ IIQJO. VAUG_ v""", ••
""'NO. • SQ.••. .-

I~ANo. RAULM. Lot 27. 400 sc.m, P6OO.OO-=00(13- .) •••.•• , ........, BSock122,
Psd-13OO11502

All b-ds must be sealed and submitted to the above-mentioned Division,
on or be' ore the hour and date stated above and plainly marked· Bid for
Land Described rr MSA / SA / IGPSA No. (13-1) 4447 • Bids must be
accornparned with cash, money. order, treasury warrant, certified check,
casnter's check or-nanager's check for a sum equivalent to 10% ofthe bid.
TIIen a I)id is wlt,drawn after the highest bidder is determined, the
corresponding deposit therefore shall be forfeited to the government. No
bid Shall De less than the appraised value ofthe land. The right is reserved
to reject any or all bids.

,QueZM City, Philippines -' __

(Sgd.)
ATTY. ALVIN JOSEPH O. CONSTANTINO

Chief, licenses, Patents and Deeds Division

Department of Environment and Natural Resources
NATIONAL CAPITAL REGION

SALE OF PUBLIC LANDS

Notice is hereby given that the Department of Environment and Natural
Resources, National Capital Region, Patents and Deeds Section, in pursuance
to Administrative Order No 38 dated 19 April 1990, will sell at NliB::
NCR Licenses Patents and Deeds Division National Ec%gyCenter East
Avenue DWman QUezon City. through sealed bidding to the highest bidder
at 10:00 A.M. on MARCH 28, 2023, the tract of land situated in fQ!l
Bonifacio iOQWWestern Blcutan Taguig City which are specificallydescribed
below to wit:

~~I~I ~:g~1
PUN••.

AREAl" I_I TOTAl I TOTAL.
IQ.M. YAUJEDPOt YALUf.:OF YAUJlEOf

SQ.M. I.AfrI) IM'RO'IIBIEJifT

='~784 I~R'I a':. ~jg i 441sq.m. I PhP6OO.OO I~j ~
P»13001602

All bids must be sealed and submitted to the above-mentioned Division,
on or before the hour and date stated above and plainly marked" Bid for Land
Described in MSA / SA / IGPSA No. 007607-2195 • 8ids must be
accompanied with cash, money. order, treasury warrant, certified check,
cashier's check or manager's check for a sum equivalent to 10% of the bid.
Then a bid is withdrawn after 'the highest bidder is determined, the
corresponding deposit therefore shall be forfeited to the government. No bid
shall be less than the appraised value of the land. The right is reserved to
reject any or all bids.

Quezon City, Philippines,-' .-:... _

(Sgd.)
ATTY. ALVIN JOSEPH G. CONSTANTINO

Chief, L censes, Patents and Deeds Division

~:a Republic ofthe Philippines'...:!...,;;"..Department of Env.ronrnent and Natural Resources
...:::.: NATIONAL CAPITAL REGION

National. Ecology Center East Avenue, Diliman, Quezon City.;
SALE OF PUBLIC LANDS

Notice is hereby given that the Department of Environment and Natural
Resources, National Caprtal Region, Patents and Deeds Section, In pursuance
to Administrative Order No. 38 dated 19 April 1990, will sell at ~
Ucenses PatentsaodOeedsDMsion National Ecology Center EastAvenue
Di/iman Quezon Cjty, through sealed bidding to the highest bidder at 10:00
A.M. on MARCH 28, 2023, the tract of land situated in Brgy. Western
Bicutan fPinagsamijl Taguig Crtvwhich are specifically described below to
wit:

i-- ••••• OF LOTNG, MfA IN ..........., ""AI. TOTAl.- ......,.,., BULNO./ SQM. VAWEDPERVAWE•• VAWE••
PUlING. SQ.M. .- -

IGf'SANo. ROSWOB. lot 9, 84sq.m. PtlP140.00 F'tf'U,7eo..oo ""'-=007607-1899 .......- -,
""""""""

All bids must be sealed and submitted to the above-mentioned Division,
on or before the hour and date stated above and plainly marked" Bid for land
Described in MSA / SA / IGPSA No. 007607-1899 • Bids must be
accompanied with cash, money, order, treasury warrant, certified check,
cashier's check or manager's check for a sum equivalent to 10% of the bid.
Then a bid is withdrawn after the highest bidder is determined, the
corresponding deposit therefore shall be forfeited to the government. No bid
shall be less than the appraised value of the land. The right is reserved to
reject any or all bids.

Quezon City, Philippines i -
(Sgd.)

ATTY. ALVIN JOSEPH O. CONSTANTINO
Chief,licenses, Patents and Deeds Division

MSG/ JCP/DlM

Department of Environment and Natural R_rcn
HAT10NAL CAPITAL REGION

SALE OF PUBUC LANDS

Notice is hereby given that the Department of Environment and Nat~ral
Ilesources, National Capital Reg1on, Patents and Deeds Section, in pursuance
10 Administrati,e Order No. 38 dated 19 April 1990, will sell at LlftiB;
JI/e8 Lice?ses eatentsandDeel1sDivfsjQQ NationalEcotogyCenter East
,~liman Quezon City. through sealed bidding to the highest bidder
lit 10:00 A.M. on APRIL 04, 2023, the tract of land situated in llm.
Western Bicutan 'now Pinagsamal Tagujg City which are specifiC8t1~
clescribed below to wit:

~•....- -. -~_.klMlBl APPUCANT 8lX. NO.1 SQ.M..........
.-C--:=~~R.. ~~, 78.40 SQ.m.

""""""""'
All bids must be sealed and submitted to the abov&-mentloned DIvision,

on or before the hour and date stated above and plainly marked· Bid for Land
Cle~cribed in MSA / SA / IGPSA No. 007607-2260 • Bids must be
accompanied with cash, money, order, treasury warrant, certified check,
cashier's check or manager's check for a sum equivalent to 10% of the bid.
Then a bid is withdrawn after the highest bidder is determined, the
c ""esponding deposit therefore shall be forfeited to the government- No bid
shall be less than the appraised value of the land. The right is reserved to
mject'any or all bids.

Quezon City, Philippines,_~--O '

(SjJ:L)
ATTY. ALVlN.IOSEPIIa.CONSTANTINO

Chief, Ucenses, Patents and Deeds Division

NOV.22, 29 DEC. 8,11, 20, 27 EMZ

Department of Environment and Natural Resources
NATIONAL CAPITAL REGION

SALE OF PUBLIC LANDS

Notice is hereby given that the Department of Environment and Natural
Resources, National Capital Region, Patents and Deeds Section,lPDD, in
pursuance to Administrative Order No. 38 dated 19April 1990,will sell at
DENR-NCR Licenses Patents and Deeds Diyisioo National ECQtqgvCeoter
East Avenue DWman Quezon City, through sealed bidding to the highest
bidder at 10:00 A.M. on MARCH 28, 2023, the tract of land situated in
Bmy Fort Bonifacjo 'oowWes1em Bjcutanl TagujgCjtvwhich are specifically
described below to wit:

MfA INSQ.M. ""AI. I TOTAL. I
VAUGPERI VALUEOF VALUEOF

SQ.M. lMI» ~
LOT"/

BlK. NO.1
PLAN NO •

-:::"11ON I :=.:,.
IGPSANo.
(13-1) 3059

lot 5. I 450 sq.m. I P 600.00 IP 270,000.00 I N I A
""""'00,••••13001002

All bids must be sealed and submitted to the above-mentioned Division,
on or before the hour and date stated above and plainly rnarked " Bid for
land Described in MSA / SA / IGPSA No. (13-1) 3059 • Bids must be
accompanied with cash. money, order, treasury warrant, certified check,
cashier's check or manager's check for a sum equivalent to 10% of the bid.
Then a bid is withdrawn after the highest bidder is determined, the
corresponding deposit tneretore shall be forfeited to the government. No
bid shall be less than the appraised value ofthe land. The right is reserved
to reject any or all bids.

Quezon City, Philippines -'-_-'-

(Sgd.)
ATTY. ALVIN JOSEPH G. CONSTANTINO

Chief, Licenses, Patents and Deeds Division
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Republika ng Pilipi~as
-Kagawaran ng Kapaligiran at Likas Yaman

PAMBANSANG PUNONG REHIYON
National Ecology Center, EastAvenue, Diliman, umgsod ngQuezon

PAGBEBENTA NG PAMPUBUKONG LUPA

Ang pabatid na no ay ipinagkakaloob bilang patunay na ang Department of
Environment and Natural Resources-National Capitcrl Region. Patents and
Deeds Section, alinsunod sa Department Adminitrative Order No. 38, 19
April 1990, ay magkakaroon ng bilihan sa DENR-NCR National Ecology
Center East Avenue DUiman QUezon City. sa pamamagitanng isang sealed
biddingna makakapag/ligayng pinakamataas na halaga sa ika-10 ng umaga
ng MARCH 28, 2023 , ng lupang matatagpuan sa Westem Sjcutan (Pinagsa
mal Taguig Cjty na mitarawan ng mga sumusunod:

.........• P-"'''' .......... """"TNO KALA •••• ......• ......•
APUKASYOO ..........,. LOT</I'UHO LCITE •• Ll.PAKADA _NO ...........- - •••• -..-- ........alMA

IGPSANo oos.woo. Lot 9, 84 sq.m. PhPl40,OO PH'11.16O.oo """"""""001607-1899 ..,.....,. """"',Po<><lI>036Il94

Ang mga bid ay dapat na selyado at dapat isumite sa nasabing Dibisiyon,
mismo 0 bago sa itinalagang oras at petsa sa itaas at minarkahan na -Bid
for Land Described in MSA/IGPSA No. 007607-1899". Ang rnga bid sa
pag/lili ay dapat isumite sa pamamagitan ng pera, money order, treasury
warrant, sertipikadong tseke, cashier's check 0 manager's check na
nagkakahalaga ng hurnigit kumulang sa sampung porsiyento (10%) ng
islnumiteng tuting. Kung angbumibili ay nais bawiin ang kanltang dinepositong
hataga bilang alok sa pag/lili, ngunit natukoy na ang pinakamataas na bidder,
ang katumbas na deposito ay makukumpiska pabor sa pamahalaan. Ang mga
alok sa pagbili ay hindi dapatbababa sa kabuuang halaga ng nasalling lupa.
Ang pamahalaan ay may karapatang tanggihan ang isa 0 lahat ng alok sa
pag/lili kungkinakailangan.

Lungsod ng Quezon, Repubnka ng Pilipinas _

(Sgd.)
ATTY. ALVIN JOSEPH G. CONSTANTINO

Chief, Licenses, Patents and Deeds Division
MSGS/IGAS/lR~

NOY.22, 29 Me. _,13_ 20, 21 EMZ

Depertment of Environment and Natural R•••• urc... f.;
NATIONAL CAPITAL REGION •

PAGBEBENTA NG PAMPUBUKONG LUPA

Angpabatid na no ay ipinagkakaloob bilangpatunay na angOepartment of
Environment and Natural Resources-National Capital Region, Patents and
Deeds Section, alinsunod sa Department Adminitrative Order No. 38, 19
April 1990, ay magkakaroon ng bilihan sa OENR-NCR National Ecology
Center East Ayenue Di/iman Ouezon City, sa pamamagitan ng isangsealed
biddingna makakapag/ligayng pinakamataas na hataga sa ika-10 ngumaga
ng MARCH 28, 2023 , ng lupang matatagpuan sa Brgy AEPOVAI fort
Bonifacio Taguig City na inilarawan ng mga sumusunod:--.. ••••••• _NO ....T ••

_ .. ......-- .• LOTE/I'WOO LO"''' .......... _ ..
APUIW<TE ...•. ...•. ••••- ..--xl

IGf'SANo. IWJlM. lot 27. 400 sa.m. P6OO.oo ~
(13-1)4447 .......,.. Block 122 •

f'8d.13OO1602

Ang mga bldaydapa na selyado atdapat isurmte sa nasabing Oibisiyon,
mismo 0 bago sa itinalagang oras at petsa sa itaas at minarkahan na "Bid
for Land Described in MSA/IGPSA No. (13-1) 444 7". Ang rnga bid sa pagbili
ay dapat isumite sa pamamagitan ng pera, money order, treasury warrant,
sertipikadong tseke, cashier's check 0 manager's checkna nagkakahalaga
ng humigit kumulang sa sampung porsiyento (10%) ng isinumiteng turing.
Kung ang bumibil ay nais bawiin ang !<anilang dinepositonghalaga bilang alok
sa pag/lili, ngunn natukoyna ang pinakamataas na bidder, ang katumbas na
deposito aymakukumpiska paborsa pamahalaan. Angmga alok sa pag/lili ay
hindi dapat bababa sa kabuuang halaga ng nasabing lupa. Ang pamahalaan ay
may karapatang tanggihan ang isa 0 lahat ng alok sa pagnill kung
kinakailangan.

Lungsod ng Quezon, Republika ngP,liptnas, _

(Sgd.)
ATTY. ALVIN JOSEPH G. CONSTANTINO

Chief, Licenses. Patents and Deeds Division

JIIO'I.22, 2t DK ••• 11. 20, 27 IMZ

De...,tment of Environment _ Natural R••••••• rces I- NATIONAL CAPITAL REGION

PAGBEBENTA NG PAMPUBUKONG LUPA

Ang pabatid na no ay ip nagkakaloob bilang patunay na ang Department of
Environmentand Natural Resources-National Cap1tal Region, Patents and
Deeds Section, atnsunod sa Department Adminitrative Order No. 38, 19
April 1990, ay magkakaroon ng bllihan sa OENR-NCR National Ecology
Center East Avenue. Diliman Quezon City, sa pamamagitan ng isang sealed
biddingna makakapagbigay ng pinakamataas na halaga sa ika-10 ng umaga
ng APRIL 04, 2023 , ng lupang matatagpuan sa Westem Bjcutao (now
Pioagsama) Tagujg City na inilarawan ng mga sumusunod:

IIWOI •• .-..... --.. ....T •• _NO -..- .....-.........•. ••.•..•....... LOT</I'UHO • LOTE •• .....•... _ .. .........•••••• ...•. •••• -- - -IGPSANo. ........,.. .. lDt 28. 7~.40 aq.rn. Pl40.00 PH'11.ll6.OO P 100.000.00
007«)7·2260 -," -'29

PoOOO<l36894

Ang rnga blday dapat na selyado at dapat isumite sa nasabing Dibisiyon,
mismo 0 bago sa itinalagang oras at petsa sa itaas at minarkahan na "Bid
for Land Described in MSA/IGPSA No. 007607-2260". Ang mga bid sa
pagbili ay dapat isumite sa pamamagitan ng pera, money order, treasury
warrant, sertipikadong tseke, cashier's check 0 manager's check na
nagkakahalaga ng humigit kumulang sa sampung porsiyento (10%) ng
isinumitengturing. Kungangbumibili aynals bawiin angkanilangdinepositong
halaga bllangalok sa pag/lili, ngunit natukoyna angpinakamataas na bidder,
ang katumbas na deposito ay makukumpiska paborsa pamahalaan. Ang mga
a(ok sa pag/lili ay hindi dapat bababa sa kabuuang hataga ngnasabing tupa.
Ang pamahafaan ay may karapatang tanggihan ang isa 0 lahat ng ak>k sa
pagbili kungkinakailangan.

tungsod ng Quezon, Republika ng Pilipinas

(Sgd.J
ATTY, ALVINJOSEPHG.CONSTAlmNO

Chief. licenses, Patents and Deeds OMsion

-

Department of Environment •••• Nllural Resour es
NATIONAL CAPITAL REGION

PAGBEBENTA NG pAMt'UBU KUNG LUPA

Angpabatid na ito ayip_nagkakalOObbllangp.t~nayna ang
Environment and Natural Resouroes--Natlonal Oapital Regio ,Patents ar
Deeds Section, alinsunod sa Department Adr1il'itrative Ord r No. 38, 19
April 1990, ay magkakaroon ng bili1an sa 12El,~-N~9::~:'l':'~~~~
Cente' East Avenue Diliman OuelQ(l City, sa p srnarnagitan n isangsealed
biddingna makakapag/llgay ng pinakamataas na talega sa ik 10 ngumaga
ng MARCH 28, 2023 . ng lupang natat"llPl an sa . W
Western Bicytan Tagyjg City na inilerawan 'lg rr ga sumusu

BllAHfINQ PANUoLANNO BIl.AN8f1it8 IUKATNQ
APUKASYOH APUK.t.Hn lOlE/P'LANO. LOTESA.......-IGPSANo RE\'NAI.DOIt. lot 1, 441 sq.,".

007607·7&4 waDO a.x.gg
Psd-13-OO1602

Angmga bkJay dapatna selyado at :lapat isutmte sa nasabi gDibislyon,
rnlsmo 0 bago sa ltlnalagang oras at petsa sa ass at minark han na "S"
forLandDescribedinMSAj/GPSANo. J07607·'r84".Angmga dsa
ay dapat isumite sa pamamagitan ng oera, tr:O'leyorder, trea ury werr. ,
sertipikadongtseke, cestuer'« check ( manage/'s checkna na kakahalBga
ng humigit kumulang sa sampung possiyento ( 0%) ng isinu iteng tunng.
Kungangbumibili aynals bawiin angkanilangd I1I"pJsitong nata a bilangalok
sa pagbili, ngunit natukoyna ang pinak smataas "I bidder, ang atumbas na
depositoaymakukump1s~,apaborsapcmahaJ""'I ••\ngmgaalo sapag/liliay
hindidapatbababasakabuuanghalagangnas>t> rlIilupa.Ang ahalaanay
may karapatang tanggihan ang isa 0 lahat J alok sa g/lili kung
kinakailangan.

Lungsod ng Quezon, Republika ngPi 1>inas__ -rr +_
(Sgd)

ATTY, ALVIN JOSEPH G CONSTANTI
Chief, Licenses. Patents 21rul Deeds Divi ion

NOV.22, 2t DK. &.1.1 20. 27"Z

RepLblic of the Philipp is
Department of En";ronment and N" Iml Resource

_ NAnONALCAPITALREGII~1
Nationa, Ecology Center Eas; Avenue, Di •Quezon fly

_ .. ........... ....... ••••n.
AI'I.IIIA$YOOI ..•.•...... Lmf,IftA ••• LOttliA.....,

•••••••• ee,
IGPSA No. ••••••• 0•••• lot 24, 60.30 51.'"
007607·21.9!5 - -.'"~

NOY.22, 2t Die. •• 1J., ZO, 27 EMZ
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...
DATE

TlTLE: ~~_P_AG_E •••••••••••••••••• -----4-----
Republic of the Philippines __.•••• , 1 •n

Department of Environment and Natural Resources •• O£NR· 28
Provincial Eavironment and Natural Resources Office ~ P.o<:ordsUnit

Community Environment And Natural Resources Office, RElEASif
RXI-2B, Salvacion, Panabo City, Davao del Norte, 8105 Pbllippm ~~ ••:...: '
TELEFAX NO. (084)82)-20Illemai1: ~lxffi;jenr.goY·llb ~:]Il'IUV"

LEASE OF PUBLIC LANDS

Notice is hereby given that the Community Environment and Natural
Resources Office XI·2B, Salvacion, Panabo City will accept o,ralor written bids not later
than ten (10:00) o'clock in the moming on January 11,2023, for the lease for docking
purposes of the tract of land herein below described:

location
Description
Area
Appraisal (Land)

San Pedro, Panabo City
Fis 5262·0
S, 406 square meters
Php 9,700.00 per square meter or
Php 81,538,200.00 .
Php 21,864,350.00
Davao International Container Terminal, Inc.
represented by: Bonifacio 8. Ucayan

Value of Improvements
Applied for by

The successful bidder if other thM the applicant must reimburse the latter of the
expenses for the publication of the notice of lease and the survey of the land.

The right to lease the land will be awarded to the person offering the highest
annual rental, which shall not be less than three per centum (3%) of the value of the
land plus one per centum (1%) of the value of the proposed/existing improvements. In
order that a person may be entitled to participate in the bidding, he must be a qualified
public land applicant, and must, before the commencement of the same, make a deposit
equivalent of at least three (3) month's rental. On~ deposit in caSh, money order,
treasury warrant. certified checks, cashier's check or manager's check can be accepted.
A person bidding in representation of another may do so under a duly executed power of
attorney. During the bidding, the bidder has to make an additional deposit everytime his
bid is raised, to complete the three (3) month's rental, otherwise, such bid as raised shall
not be accepted. The right is served to reject any or all bids.

Panabo City, Philippines, November 16, 2022.

Republicof b,e Fhilippines
Depart~nt of Env ronmonl.lllld Natural Resources
Provincial Environrr:ent an.j141ltural Reso rees Office
Community Environment And Natural R rees

RXI·2B,Salvacion, Panabo City, aVi!O del Nor! 8105 Phi
TElEFAX NO. (084) 823-2011/el11<lil:cenrooan t/l)den.

Ipinagbibigay alam sa madla nil apg Com unity En iron ne and Natural
Resources Office XI-2B, Salvacion, Panaoc City ay tat nggap ng se~'a 0 nakasulal
na alok ~a ika alas Diyes (10:00 O'clock) n~ umaga ika 11no EnL taong 2023,
para paupahan ang isang sukat na lupang p Itlliko na inll rawan sa 'baca ", o.

Lugar
Deskripsyon
Sukat
Tasahan ng Lupa

San Pedto, Pan bo City
FiB ~.t'62·D
8, 411€;square m ters
Php 9 700.00 ka a me wad-ad 0
Kab Ilang Php 1,538,200.00
Php 21,864,350.Halaga ng nakakatayong

Proyekto
Aplikante
(DICD

DaVI!iOInternatio al Gonia ler 1errr 'lal, Inc.
reprE'Sentedby: onifacio D. L aya

Ang karapatan na uoahan ang nasabing lupa a ibibigay ;a Ie 0 partido na
makapagbibigay ng pinakamataas na upa sa iSl3ngtaon n hindi bababa s< Iiong (3%)
porsyento sa halaga ng lupa at isang (1%) porwento sa alaga ng ta}or traktura.
Upang ang isang tao ay makakasarna sa i~iasagawan subasta. karlan 19 siVa ay
karapal..<Japatna aplikante at kailang<ng bag(1magsimu ang suba ta ay Kadepostto
slya ng halagang katumbas ng tatbng totIl¥ang upa. ng deptlsrto a) ~ailangang
salaping papal, money order, cashier's (I manager' check ang a lamang
tatanggapln. Ang Isang taon na suma i sa surasta na na rerepres r 9 ng tao ay
makakasah lamang kung mayroon siyang p"lhintulot na ibinigay s pam lagitan ng
kau~~lang panhlntulot na magkaroon n9 dag(lag na de ito kapag anr yang alok
ay ~Inaas para .makumpleto ang kabuuan. tatlong b ng upa. Allg arapatang
tumanggl 0 langglhan ang anuman alok 0 sa I~.hatng alok y palagi J na<a n para sa
parnahalaan. Ang magwawagi sa ,10k na ito kung indi sya ang • kante ay
kinakailangan Mumbasan ang kabayarang nai~\lgol sa pa papalathala nq P 'lawagang
lto sa pallpapasu kat ng lupa,

Lungsod ng Panaro, Pilipinas, Nobyerntln~ 16, 2023


